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Passing Electoral Laws 

Amal Sethi1 

Laws governing electoral issues (hereinafter electoral laws) are vital to represen-
tation in a democracy and its existence. This short post outlines why and how 
electoral laws should be subject to higher approval requirements and heightened 
judicial review. 

The Importance of Electoral Laws 

In many jurisdictions, elections are the only opportunity for people to voice con-
cerns and participate in policymaking2. Nonetheless, those in power are infamous 
for limiting and/or manipulating people’s voices3. This is as old a story as it gets. 
An interesting case comes from 18th century England. Several electoral districts 
in England got depopulated over time and were left with a handful of eligible 
voters – at times less than 50. Colloquially referred to as “rotten boroughs”, the 
aforementioned electoral districts were deliberately retained4 in their depopu-
lated state to privilege influential landlords. Extant voters in rotten boroughs were 
tenants of a single landlord who exercised significant control over them. Since 
elections in those times were conducted via open ballots, the landlord knew who 
their tenants voted for. As a result, landlords could compel tenants to vote for 
themselves or their preferred representative. Before the Reform Act 1832, 140 
out of 658 parliamentary seats5 represented rotten boroughs. 

This was the precursor to modern-day gerrymandering, i.e., manipulating elec-
toral districts to create an undue advantage for a party(s). While gerrymandering 
is primarily associated with the USA6, it is a frequent phenomenon7 in other 
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jurisdictions. However, gerrymandering is not the only way to manipulate elec-
tions. Today several other sophisticated tactics8 are utilized. At the simplest level, 
it begins with making it difficult for certain sections of the populace to vote. To 
do so, those in power can complicate obtaining voter IDs, imposing stringent 
voter eligibility requirements, reducing the number of voting stations, disallow-
ing vote-by-mail, and decreasing voting times. At a more extreme level, entire 
electoral systems are designed to privilege certain groups at the expense of others. 

Tactics such as gerrymandering and voter suppression can damage the legitimacy 
of a democracy, as those in power do not adequately represent the populace. A 
lack of representation is one of the primary reasons for the global decline in trust 
in democratic institutions9. Beyond impacting the legitimacy of a democracy, 
these tactics are also used to subvert democracy. As Cheeseman and Klass state10, 
“The smartest way to rig an election is to do so before the ballots have even been 
printed.” Today, democracy is not just a system where everyone merely has the 
right to vote – even people in North Korea have voting rights11. Instead, what 
separates a democracy from a non-democracy is the rotation of power (or at least 
a realistic ability to remove those in power)12. In the absence of rotation of power, 
a polity witnesses widespread deterioration13. 

Leaders in every corner of the world are manipulating elections, making it almost 
impossible to dislodge them. Hungary is a case many readers of Verfassungsblog 
would be familiar with: Scheppele illustrates14 that Orbán’s Fidesz party and their 
coalition partners are regularly able to win elections because of an illiberally dis-
proportionate electoral system aided by a heavily gerrymandered country. Elec-
tion monitors in the recent 2022 election stated that “there is a significantly un-
equal distribution of registered voters amongst the constituencies, with up to 33 
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percent deviation, at odds with the principle of equal suffrage.”15 This election 
rigging makes it highly difficult for voters to dislodge16 Orban. 

Electoral laws are thus vital to both the maintenance and survival of democracy. 
Nevertheless, electoral laws are problematic because they are designed and im-
plemented by their beneficiaries, politicians. Evidently, politicians are likely to 
prioritize their interests over democracy and its affiliated values. It would be ex-
tremely challenging to argue that non-political actors or independent institutions 
should design election laws. This would create problems and issues related to 
democratic defects. However, a case can certainly be made for designing the pro-
cess of passing electoral laws to facilitate their optimality and democratic com-
putability. 

Higher Approval Requirements For Electoral Laws 

In more jurisdictions than not, electoral laws can be passed and reformed through 
a simple majority in the legislature. A significant reason for this is that most con-
stitutions17 frequently allow ordinary legislation to impact the specifications of 
electoral systems. This means that unless a polity has a minority government, 
electoral laws can be passed with little compromise or obstruction. This contrasts 
significantly with other essential facets of democracy, such as human rights and 
the powers of the governmental branches, which frequently require constitu-
tional amendments to be altered. While it can be argued that the calibration pro-
cesses of amendment rules across many jurisdictions require rethinking, in most 
societies with written constitutions, constitutional amendments require higher 
legislative approval. This does mandate a degree of compromise with diverse po-
litical actors – including often from across political aisles. 

Few things can impact ‘the people’s ability to choose their representatives and 
vote them out’ more than the laws governing elections. Given their democratic 
significance, why should electoral laws be created the same way as ordinary law? 
Though it could be argued that written constitutions should cover all election-
related matters since then, we can ensure that altering electoral rules would re-
quire a constitutional amendment. Frequently that is an impractical option con-
sidering how detailed electoral laws are. 
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Nonetheless, some alternative options exist. When it comes to electoral laws, I 
contend that it should be a sin quo non for polities to at least adopt either of these 
two options: First, designate electoral laws in the category of organic laws18 or 
other similar special categories. Organic laws lay down foundational matters of a 
polity and generally have higher requirements for approval and modification. 
Second, formally recognize a separate type of law known as “electoral laws”, hav-
ing stricter approval requirements in legislatures. Although defining the precise 
contours of what constitutes electoral laws is beyond the scope of this short post, 
it would be imperative to define its scope – preferably within constitutions – and 
do so broadly. Electoral laws should include all laws that in any way concern elec-
tions, including the regulation and financing of political parties. 

Organic laws covering electoral matters and requiring higher approval are seen 
in civil law jurisdictions like France and Spain19 and a handful of other systems20 
inspired by these jurisdictions. Likewise, special categories of laws with distinct 
approval requirements also exist. For example, in Belgium, legislation concerning 
institutional matters and competencies of the communities and regions require 
qualified majorities21 for their passing. Similarly, special categories such as 
“money bills”22 are present in many common law countries with approval require-
ments different (albeit lower) from ordinary laws. Hence, though not ubiquitous, 
the proposal for separate approval requirements for electoral laws is not ex-
tremely radical in the grand scheme of things. 

Regarding the precise higher requirements for passing electoral laws, at a bare 
minimum, passing them should require qualified majorities, which could ensure 
some negotiation and compromise with opposition political parties. Nevertheless, 
the rise of anti-democratic populist parties in countries like Hungary and Turkey 
demonstrates that such requirements might not always be sufficient. Temporary 
spurts in popularity – aided by peculiar existing electoral rules and institutional 
design – frequently see anti-democratic populist parties obtaining a high number 
of seats in legislatures. This allows them to bypass the requirements of a qualified 
majority unilaterally. Conversely, scholars have argued that qualified majorities23 
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are often insufficient to prevent misuse. A better alternative option might be uti-
lizing comparable approval procedures for electoral laws that Thailand uses for 
constitutional amendments24. For an amendment to be approved in Thailand, it 
requires at least 20 percent votes from legislators not part of the governing coa-
lition. Such provisions guarantee that even if a coalition – for whatever reason –
crosses a qualified majority threshold, they still need to negotiate with a certain 
number of opposition actors. Several similar creative solutions can be considered 
to ensure greater inclusion and compromise. 

While not wholly eliminating misuse of electoral laws, such requirements can 
reduce their frequency. At the bare minimum, these requirements might prevent 
a ruling coalition from unilaterally remaking the democratic process to suit their 
ambitions for power at the expense of other parties and the democratic process. 
Moreover, there is anecdotal empirical evidence from general constitution-mak-
ing processes, as seen here25, here26, and here27, concerning how group inclusion 
and compromise can enhance democratic features in a polity and how a lack of 
the same diminishes results in opposite outcomes. 

Although the proposed solutions will make updating electoral systems more ar-
duous, I believe that it is a justifiable cost considering the importance of a free 
and fair electoral process. 

A Heightened Role For Courts 

When laws relating to elections have higher approval requirements, the ruling 
coalition might likely attempt to pass electoral laws by selectively including elec-
toral topics in other, more mundane bills. In a very different context, we already 
have examples of the same. In India, the ruling BJP government does not have 
enough seats in the upper house of the parliament to pass legislation without 
multi-partisan support. Therefore, they changed the campaign finance provisions 
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by sneaking new legislation into the finance act28 – an act that can be passed as 
a money bill. In India, money bills are not required to go through both houses of 
the legislature as opposed to other bills, which are subject to bicameralism’s con-
straints. Similar cases are bound to arise in the regime proposed above. Today’s 
autocrats have mastered the art of wielding the law in abusive ways29 to forward 
their agendas. Therefore, some external oversight is necessary. Arguably, this is 
where courts can step in. 

At the outset, I acknowledge that courts have proved to be an inefficient check 
on would-be-autocrats – mainly due to the realities of the institutional politics of 
actors without the powers of the purse and sword30. In the case of India men-
tioned above, the Supreme Court frequently allowed the BJP government to pass 
ostensibly non-monetary bills as money bills31. Nonetheless, this certainly does 
not mean we should give up on courts – at least theoretically. Therefore, courts 
could (and should) have a role in ensuring that all electoral issues are passed with 
higher approval requirements. In doing so, they should resolve any doubts in fa-
vor of requiring a higher approval threshold. Generally, I have cautioned against 
over-reliance on courts32, but providing courts with a veto over passing electoral 
laws could be a desirable use of judicial oversight. Even if courts have not demon-
strated effectiveness, allowing them to police electoral laws at least gives them a 
fighting chance. They might be able to step in during the early stages of a polity’s 
democratic decline before authoritarian restrictions curtail them. 

Beyond procedural matters, courts also have a role in substantive issues. At times, 
larger democratic parties work together to decrease the representativeness of 
politics. For example, large status-quo parties can collaborate to increase their 
hegemony at smaller parties’ expense or make it difficult for new parties to 
emerge. In an advanced democracy like Germany, some of these issues have re-
cently occupied the headlines and caught the attention of legal scholars33. This is 
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another area where judicial intervention could be supported. Moreover, the the-
orization of the American law professor, John Hart Ely34, might be relevant in 
such areas. Ely envisions a vital role for courts in ensuring that the channels of 
political participation remain open and protecting minorities that the ordinary 
political process might neglect. Today, Ely’s views have migrated beyond Amer-
ica’s borders35. It might be prudent for courts to examine electoral laws with an 
Elyian lens and ensure that these laws do not prevent political participation or 
discriminate against minorities. In doing so, a case can also be made that in eval-
uating electoral laws, courts should always apply strict standards of scrutiny and 
demand that elected branches explain why passing specific electoral laws are nec-
essary and would not result in negative democratic consequences. 

Lastly, relating to courts, it could be contended that, akin to France36, any law 
relating to elections be referred to and approved by the respective court before 
they are promulgated. While entirely not against it, in the age of ‘judicialization 
of mega-politics37, I would caution against adopting pre-enactment review as a 
universal requirement. In jurisdictions with extremely powerful courts, this could 
result in over-judicializing election issues in a manner that is not desirable in a 
democracy and/or over-exacerbating the tensions between the judicial and 
elected branches. 

The Way Forward 

While the suggestions throughout this article would not wholly prevent the ma-
nipulation of electoral processes, they could certainly strengthen democratic safe-
guards. 

Moreover, while this short post considered electoral laws, other related areas 
might also require attention. Arguably, the most important of these areas is the 
conduct of elections. Although, as stated above, electoral manipulation often hap-
pens far before the actual elections. However, election-day misconduct is too 
commonplace38 to ignore entirely. While arguing for non-political actors to de-
sign electoral laws would likely be too radical, there is a strong case for 
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independent election commissions overseeing the electoral process. Such cases 
are frequently made39 and have even had a significant impact on real-world prac-
tice. Nevertheless, many electoral oversight institutions have not necessarily 
made40 it harder to manipulate elections. Therefore, perhaps the design of inde-
pendent election commissions is a pressing question that should also be exam-
ined in detail. 

In conclusion, I hope all stakeholders investigate and uncover the best ways to 
make our election processes democratic and resilient. 
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