
O'Donohue/Tecimer – Why Party Bans Often Don’t Work 

208 

Why Party Bans Often Don’t Work: How an Attempt to Ban Tur-
key’s AKP Backfired 

Andrew O'Donohue1/Cem Tecimer2 

In July 2008, in an intensely debated and enormously consequential case, Tur-
key’s Constitutional Court weighed whether to close the ruling Justice and Devel-
opment Party (AKP) and ban its 71 leading members, including then-Prime Min-
ister Recep Tayyip Erdoğan.3 Six of the eleven justices voted in favor – falling just 
one vote short of the super-majority required to dissolve the AKP and bar its 
leaders from politics for five years.4 

More than 15 years after the AKP closure case, Turkey has experienced signifi-
cant democratic backsliding,5 and Erdoğan has secured a third term as president,6 
extending his tenure in office into 2028. A historic opposition victory in the 
March 2024 local elections7 demonstrated that the AKP can still be beaten and 
offered a glimpse of a “post-Erdoğan Turkey.”8 Nonetheless, Turkey offers a cru-
cial case for understanding why party bans often do not work – and an example 
from which other embattled democracies must learn. 

Far from weakening the AKP or deterring illiberal behavior, we argue that this 
attempted party closure backfired and accelerated Turkey’s democratic erosion. 
The closure case enabled the AKP to rally public support for institutional changes 
to the judiciary, and the case’s prosecutors made strategic mistakes that undercut 
the prosecution’s legitimacy. 
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What, then, could have been a more effective legal strategy for protecting de-
mocracy? We underscore that party bans are not a long-term solution or substi-
tute for systemic political reforms. Although the tools of “militant democracy”9 
may be useful, the Turkish case suggests that targeted legal interventions, rather 
than sweeping party bans, may be more effective at safeguarding democracy. 

How attempted party bans can backfire 

When Turkey’s Constitutional Court came just one vote short of banning the AKP, 
one might have expected that the AKP would be chastened, with the judges’ ver-
dict acting as a warning. Indeed, ten of the eleven justices voted to reduce state 
funding for the AKP, on the grounds that the party had become a center of “anti-
secular activities.”10 

Instead, we argue that the prosecution against the AKP backfired. Within Tur-
key’s ruling party, the closure case cemented the belief that the AKP needed to 
tame a judiciary that was staunchly opposed to the party. What is more, the clo-
sure case enabled the AKP to argue to voters that the judiciary was an anti-dem-
ocratic constraint on the popular will and that constitutional changes were nec-
essary to democratize Turkey’s political system. 

On the heels of the closure case, the AKP proposed a constitutional referendum 
in 2010.11 In addition to increasing civilian oversight over the military, the referen-
dum promised to increase the elected government’s appointments within the judi-
ciary by enlarging the number of seats on the Constitutional Court and Supreme 
Board of Judges and Prosecutors.12 The 2010 referendum passed by a wide margin, 
with 58% support, and demonstrated a popular mandate for institutional reform.13 

Appealing to perceptions that the judiciary was partisan and anti-democratic, 
then-Prime Minister Erdoğan campaigned for the referendum as a step toward 
greater democracy. When celebrating the passage of the referendum in 2010, 
Erdoğan stated “The ‘yes’ verdict in today’s referendum is a result of our nation’s 
longing for democracy.”14 
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To this day, President Erdoğan argues that he and his party have strengthened 
the rule of law after years of victimization by the judiciary. As Turkey’s president 
stated in a 2022 speech, “As a politician who has been subjected to many unlawful 
accusations, harassments, and punishments in the past, I have been struggling to 
strengthen Turkey’s rule of law since the day I came to power.”15 Turkey’s legacy 
of party bans, as well as the 2008 closure case against the AKP, helped enable 
Erdoğan to claim the mantle of democracy and cast the courts as anti-democratic. 

How not to prosecute party bans 

An important reason why the closure case against the AKP backfired has to do 
with the way in which the case was prosecuted. From the outset, the prosecution 
was beset with tactical errors. First, the timing of the case was inopportune. Sec-
ond, the evidence the prosecutors submitted against the AKP was weak and at 
times even speculative 

By the time the prosecutors launched the closure case against the AKP in March 
2008, the party had already won three consecutive and decisive electoral victo-
ries. In the 2002 general election, which was the party’s first electoral contest, 
the AKP wonafter garnering 34 percent of the national vote. 16 That result trans-
lated into a disproportionate parliamentary supermajority of nearly 66 percent, 
due to the 10-percent national election threshold at the time that excluded a num-
ber of smaller parties from parliament. Only two years later, in 2004, the AKP won 
a landslide in nationwide local elections, increasing its vote share by eight percent 
to a total of 42 percent.17 Then, in the July 2007 general election, less than a year 
before the prosecutors initiated the 2008 closure case, the AKP received 46.6 per-
cent of the national vote, marking its third consecutive electoral victory.18 

Moreover, the AKP’s 2007 electoral victory came in the aftermath of a presiden-
tial election crisis in which the AKP’s candidate, Abdullah Gül, ultimately secured 
the requisite majority in parliament and was elected president, following several 
attempts by the secular main opposition to block the process.19 
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In sum, by March 2008, when the closure case began, the AKP had won three 
decisive electoral victories, both in general and local elections, in addition to suc-
cessfully appointing its candidate as president. That made the timing of the clo-
sure case inauspicious: prosecutors waited until after the AKP had solidified its 
legitimacy through elections. 

An evidentiary problem compounded this issue of poor timing. Shortly after the 
case began, it became clear that prosecutors were relying on a hodgepodge of 
circumstantial, and sometimes even speculative, evidence. For example, among 
the admitted evidence in the closure case was an interview that then-Prime Min-
ister Erdoğan gave to the Malaysian newspaper, The New Straits Times. The pros-
ecutors proffered Erdoğan’s remark during that interview that “Turkey can serve 
as a model of how Islam and democracy can coexist in a harmonious way” as 
purported evidence that he wanted to establish an Islamic republic in Turkey.20 
“I am not secular as a person; the state is secular. I am, on the other hand, re-
sponsible for preserving the secular order” was another quotation offered as evi-
dence by the prosecution. 

Erdoğan’s following comment in another interview, featured in the German Welt 
am Sonntag in February 2005, was also in evidence: “A democratic country must 
guarantee the freedom of religion. This includes, within the confines of the laws, 
citizens’ religious expressions through symbols.”21 

These purported pieces of evidence quickly generated a widespread sense among 
politicians and the public that the closure case was not motivated by legal merits 
but rather by party politics. By waiting until the AKP had bolstered its legitimacy 
through elections – and then failing to substantiate their case with convincing 
evidence – the prosecutors significantly undermined the legitimacy of their case. 

Why party bans aren’t a long-term solution 

Even when party bans are prosecuted effectively, the Turkish experience suggests 
that they are frequently a short-term fix, not a long-term solution. Turkey offers 
numerous examples to suggest that when political parties have deep-rooted pop-
ular support, banning them often amounts to a game of judicial whack-a-mole. 

Consider Erdoğan’s own rise in Turkish politics. When Erdoğan first rose to na-
tional prominence after being elected mayor of Istanbul in 1994, he was a mem-
ber of the Islamist Welfare Party.22 Yet in 1998, the Welfare Party was banned 
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from politics by the Constitutional Court for engaging in “anti-secular activi-
ties.”23 Erdoğan himself was convicted, imprisoned for several months, and 
banned from politics for reciting a poem deemed to incite religious hatred.24 

However, these bans could not prevent widespread popular support for religious 
political parties and candidates from achieving political representation. A succes-
sor to the Welfare Party, the Virtue Party, was quickly established in 1997 – only 
to be promptly banned in 2001 for its “anti-secular activities.”25 Then, in 2001 
Erdoğan and his allies founded the Justice and Development Party – which 
branded itself as “conservative democratic” and “antiestablishment” without la-
beling itself as Islamist.26 The judiciary was playing whack-a-mole, rather than 
offering a sustainable solution to incorporate religious voters into politics. 

If anything, Erdoğan’s past imprisonment and ban from politics may only have 
bolstered his standing in the eyes of more religious voters. As Kaya Genç ob-
serves, “The legal stain [of imprisonment], which the judiciary planned as a way 
to terminate his career, maximized Erdogan’s popularity, since pious Turks now 
viewed him as their voice, which the state wanted to silence.”27 

Given the significant well of popular support for religious, conservative parties in 
Turkey, repeated party bans could not prevent the long-term emergence of such 
parties. The persistent use of such bans represented a failure of the Turkish po-
litical establishment to learn and adopt long-term institutional solutions to in-
clude religious voices in Turkey’s political system. 

What works better than party bans 

If party bans often are not effective remedies, what alternative legal strategies 
might be? The risk that party bans may backfire, coupled with difficulties in pros-
ecuting such cases, makes it all the more important for the judiciary to appreciate 
the panoply of options at its disposal. 

One alternative is middle-way options. An asset freeze would very likely accom-
plish the objective of a ban by depriving the political party of its financial re-
sources and thereby weakening it. For example, freezing party assets, either tem-
porarily or permanently, could be a useful alternative to outright closure, to the 
extent the law permits it. An asset freeze can cover current and/or future financial 
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resources, including, for example, state aid not yet disbursed to a party. Moreo-
ver, an asset freeze can be partial or total, extending to some or all of a party’s 
finances. Thus, an asset freeze permits the judiciary to fashion an individualized 
and case-specific remedy that would account for the length, seriousness, and per-
vasiveness of the threat posed by a political party. That, in turn, incentivizes 
judges to engage in a case-by-case inquiry that promotes considerations of fair-
ness, moderation, and proportionality. 

A second alternative that judges and prosecutors should consider is targeted legal 
interventions. More often than not, party bans focus on a number of higher-level 
operatives within a political party, as opposed to its rank and file. Targeted 
measures aimed at specific party leaders and using the tools of ordinary criminal 
and civil law could accomplish the same. Targeted asset freezes, to the extent the 
party in question is largely financed by one or a number of individuals, is a fur-
ther possibility. If the party leadership is criminally culpable for closure-related 
crimes or other offenses, which would likely be the case, ordinary criminal pros-
ecution is another option. 

Such targeted measures carry their own risks: for instance, sanctioning higher-
level party officials individually may pose the risk of creating unintended political 
martyrs. Still, less-than-closure measures could avoid the political cost of banning 
a party outright. While targeted sanctions might still make martyrs of a few spe-
cific politicians, full party bans risk creating an entire cadre of political martyrs 
and providing fodder to a domestic and international perception that the banning 
jurisdiction is anti-democratic. What is more, these targeted measures would 
keep the option of a full closure on the table, thereby leaving open the possibility 
of a ban as a future deterrent. 

Turkey’s experience offers the sobering lesson that when prosecutors seek the 
maximalist penalty of an outright party ban, such legal interventions can danger-
ously backfire. As democracies globally grapple with the challenge of prosecuting 
high-ranking politicians and weighing whether to ban political parties, the Turk-
ish case offers valuable insights for judges, prosecutors, and citizens alike. 
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